
2010  Coast Guard Elite Athletes of the Year
YN3 Syreeta Bromfield, is 
stationed at PSSU Miami.  
YN3 Bromfield

YN3 Bromfield  gave 
back to her community 
through an activeYN3 Bromfield 

distinguished herself as 
one of the best female 
basketball players in the 
Armed Forces.  As a 
member of the Navy 
Women’s Basketball 
Team, she lead the team 
in scoring and 
rebounding.  She was also 

through an active 
involvement in the 
Pennsylvania’s Third 
Annual Walk for the 
Wounded to help raise 
funds to support our 
nations wounded heroes 
and their families.  She 
also brought her 
enthusiasm to the annual g

selected to represent  
the U. S. Military on the 
All Armed Forces 
Basketball Team, which 
participated in the First 
CISM Women’s Military 
World Games held in 
Seoul, Korea.   YN3 
Bromfield was selected as 
th fifth t l d i

Children’s Holiday Bash 
at Miami Dade College 
helping plant the seed in 
the children’s mind of the 
importance of attending 
college. 

YN3 Syreeta Bromfield

the fifth top player during 
the games and she also 
received the power 
forward award for the 
best player at her 
position.    

LT Ken Burgess is 
stationed at SFLC, 
detached duty Oakland, 
CA.  LT Burgess 
distinguished himself in

LT Burgess serves as 
President and founding 
member of the USCG 
Running Club, which is 
dedicated to getting hisdistinguished himself in 

the sport of running.  LT 
Burgess was selected to 
the 2010 All-Navy Cross 
Country Team where he 
finished sixth-sixth at the 
USA Track and Field 
Winter Championships 
with elite cross country 
runners in the Armed 
F d h h

dedicated to getting his 
shipmates involved in 
running and leading a 
healthier lifestyle.   He 
also recently completed 
his third season as coach 
for his local middle school 
cross country team. 

Forces and throughout 
the United States.  He was 
also selected to the 2010 
All-Navy Marathon Team 
where he helped the Navy 
Team win second place 
among the armed forces 
at the armed forces 
marathon championship 
held in conjunction with

LT Ken Burgess

held in conjunction with 
the 2010 Marine Corps 
marathon.   At the 
Marine Corps marathon 
he finished  twenty-eight 
out of the 21, 948 
entrants.


